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EE

SUBJECT

CHAIR AND MEMBERS
BUILT AND NATURAL ENVIRONMENT COMMITTEE

MEETING ON MONDAY, AUGUST 15, 2011

That on the recommendation of the Director of Water and City Engineer, the following actions
be TAKEN:

a) That the tender bids received for Winter Maintenance Equipment with Operators Trucks
with Sander/Salter Bodies with, BE ACCEPTED, as follows:

B & A Davies Trucking lnc., 5279 Colonel Talbot Rd., London, ON NOP 1H8 - 4 Units
$117 .751hr., $1 18.75lhr., $123.93/hr. and $134.43/hr.

Mobil Striping & Sweeping Ltd., 35 Bayview Court, London, ON NsW 5W4 - 2 Units
$1 24.50/hr . and $124.50/hr.

Edgar Diversified lnc., 28 Portal Cr., London, ON NsX 2E4 - 1 Unit $128.00/hr.

BLR Contracting & Excavating, 250 West St., Belmont, ON NOL 180 - 2 Units
$129.401hr, and $1 39 .49lhr.

JOHN BRAAM
DIRECTOR OF WATER AND CITY ENGINEER

TENDER I1-56
WINTER MAINTENANCE EQUIPMENT WITH OPERATORS -

TRUCKS WITH SANDER/SALTER qODTES WrrH PLOW

RECOMMENDATION

Roy Wonnacott Trucking Ltd., 5309 Nine Mile Rd., R.R. #3, llderton, ON NOM 2A0 - 2
Units $134.00/hr. and $138.00/hr.

1841635 Ontario lnc., 15095 Eight Mile Rd., Arva, ON NOM 1G0 - 2 Units
$138.00/hr. and $138.00/hr.

A.C. HunterTrucking Ltd., 1781 Phillbrook Crt, London, ON N5X 223 - 1 Unit
$138.88/hr.

S & B Const'n Ltd., 36312 Talbot Line, Shedden, ON NOL 2E0 - 2 Units
$1 37.99/hr. and $1 39.99/hr.

Allan Cunningham, 35317 Coursey Line, R.R. #1, Lucan, ON NOM 2J0 - 2 Units
$1 34.75/hr. and $1 34 .7 5lhr.

That Civic Administration BE AUTHORIZED to undettake all the administrative acts that
are necessary in connection with this contract, and;

That approval hereby given BE CONDITIONAL upon the Corporation entering into a
formal contract or having a purchase order, or contract record relating to the subject
matter of this approval.

b)

c)
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None.
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PREVIOUS REPORTS PERTINENT TO THIS MATTER

Eø

Purchasing Process
Tender T11-56 for Winter Maintenance Equipment with Operators - Trucks with Sand/Salter
Bodies with Plows was issued and twenty-two (22) contractors submitted bids for a total of fifty-
five (55) units. lt be noted that two (2) bidders were rejected for non-original signatures and one
(1) bidder for not including a list of equipment. A total of eighteen (18) units are required to
maintain City winter operations for a five (5) year contract term.

It ig anticipated that the nine (9) recommend contractors will meet all the terms, conditions and
specifications outlined in T11-56.

A summary of bids is attached as Appendix A

Financial lmpact
Funding for this expenditure is provided in the approved annual operating budgets.

Acknowledgements
This report was prepared with input from John Parsons, Division Manager, Transportation and
Roadside Operations and Chris Ginty, CPPB, Procurement Officer, Purchasing & Supply.

BACKGROUND

AND ROADSIDE OPERATIONS

REVIEWED & CONCURRED BY:

MIKE TURNER
DEPUTY CITY TREASURER
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DESCRIPTION

Tender 11-56 Winter Maintenance Equipment with Operators - Trucks with $ander/ Salter Bodies with Plow - Summary of Bids

Hourly rate with
under body blade.

Edgar
Diversified

Hourly rate with
front blade

Hourly rate with
front mounted
blade & wing

UNIT 1

Foster

Envlronmental

Sery¡ces

$128.00

No Bid

UNIT I

DESCRIPTION

Prentice
Trucking Ltd.

No Bid

No Bid

Hourly rate with
under Þody blade.

$167.00

Hourly rate with
front blade

UNIT I

Shawn Hansford

Trucklng &

Excavallng lnc.

$187.00

Hourly rate with
front mounted
blade & wing

No Bid

Wayne Garsey

Appendix A

Unit I

5t75.00

UNIT 1

No Bid

Wyatt Erp

Trucking

No Bid

$140.00

$145.00

Unit 2

No Bid

UNIT 1

No Bid

No Bid

BLR Contracting & Excavating

City of London

No Bid

No Bid

$150.00

Allan Cunningham

Unit I

149.00

UNIT 1

No Bid

No Bid

$134.75

No Bid

$129.40

Unit 2

$144.75

UNIT 2

No Bid

No Bid

1564242 Ontario Ltd.

No Bid

s134.75

$13s.40

J.L.C Landscaping lnc.

Unit I

$144.75

UNIT I

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$140.00

$149.50

Unit 2

No Bid

UN]T 2

No Bid

No Bid

Mobil Striping & Sweeping Ltd.

C.R. Chittick Construction Ltd.

No Bid

$140.00

$149.50

Unit I

No Bid

UN]T 1

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$124.50

Unit 2

$1 65.00

UNIT 2

No Bid

No Bid

s208.00

No Bid

$124.50

Unit I

$165.00

1841635 Ontario lnc.

No Bid

No Bid

$208.00

s138.00

Unit 2

$250.00

No Bid

$r38.00

Unit 3

No Bid

No Bid

$143.00

No Bid
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DESCRIPTION

Tender I l-56 Winter Maintenance Equipment with Operators - Trucks with Sander/ Salter Bodies with Plow - Summary of Bids

Hourly rate with
under body blade.

Hourly rate with
front blade

Hourly rate with
front mounted
blade & wing

Unit I

A.C. Hunter Trucking Ltd.

$138.88

No Bid

Unit 2

DESCRIPTION

No Bid

s147.40

Hourly rate with
under body blade.

No Bid

Hourly rate with
front blade

Unit 3

No Bid

$167.00

Hourly rate with
front mounted
blade & wing

Appendix A

Unit I

E&W Blane trucking & Excavating Ltd.

No Bid

Unít I

No Bid

No Bid

$140.00

Mr. Roy Wonnacott

$134.00

Unit 2

No Bid

Unit 2

No Bid

No Bid

Gity of London

No Bid

sr40.00

$138.00

Unit 3

No Bid

Unit 3

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$r40.00

$143.00

Unit 4

No Bid

Unit I

No Bíd

$r47.00

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Unit I

S&B Construction Ltd.

$137.99

Unit 2

No Bid

No Bid

$r73.99

No Bid

$l t 8.75

Unit 2

B&A Davies Trucking lnc.

$139,99

Unit 3

No Bid

No Bid

$178.99

No Bid

ç117.75

Unit 3

$14t.99

Unit 4

No Bid

No Bid

$224.99

No Bid

$1 23.93

Unit 4

s142.99

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$134.43

Unit 5

No Bid

No Bid

$156.43

No Bid
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DESCRIPTION

Appendix A

Tender 1l-56 Winter Maintenance Equipment with Operators - Trucks with Sander/ Salter Bodies with Plow * Summary of Bids

Hourly rate with
under body blade.

þE
:*

åH

Hourly rate with
front blade

Hourly rate with
front mounted
blade & wing

Unit 1

No Bid

$r55.00

Unit 2

No Bid

No Bld

C.H. Trucking (London) lnc.

$170.00

Unit 3

No Bid

No Bid

$200.00

Unit 4

No Bid

No Bid

$220.00

Unit 5

No Bid

No Bid

Gity of London

$250.00

Unit 6

No Bid

No Bid

s250.00

No Bid
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