

Tender 12-59 Automotive Lubricants - Appendix A

Item	Description	Unit	Estimate Usage	Noco Lubricants		London Mack		Bluewave Energy		A & M Truck Parts Ltd.		Peterbilt Ontario Truck Centres		Progressive Industrial Fluids		Safety Kleen		LubeSource		Petro-Canada Lubricants		CaseN Drum Oil	
				Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price
15001	AW88, Hydraulic Oil Performance Plus no. 31AW68XEB	20L Pail	64	\$69.07	\$4,420.48	\$63.06	\$4,035.84	\$48.60	\$3,110.40	\$53.20	\$3,404.80	\$65.35	\$4,182.40	\$43.20	\$2,764.80	\$29.68	\$1,899.52	\$41.38	\$2,648.32	\$61.80	\$3,955.20	\$44.90	\$2,873.60
13239	Duration, Universal Tractor Fluid Performance Plus no. 25HUTDHB	205L Drum	5	\$833.67	\$4,168.35	\$699.65	\$3,498.25	\$571.95	\$2,859.75	\$664.16	\$3,320.80	\$744.99	\$3,724.95	\$576.41	\$2,882.05	\$357.69	\$1,788.45	\$523.40	\$2,617.00	\$639.60	\$3,198.00	\$487.90	\$2,439.50
13238	Duration, Universal Tractor Fluid - Performance Plus no. 25HUTDHB	20L Pail	38	\$79.09	\$3,005.42	\$71.10	\$2,701.80	\$59.00	\$2,242.00	\$68.40	\$2,599.20	\$73.69	\$2,800.22	\$58.35	\$2,217.30	\$39.66	\$1,507.08	\$50.37	\$1,914.06	\$65.40	\$2,485.20	\$50.96	\$1,936.48
15000	AW46, Hydraulic Oil Performance Plus no. 31AW46XEB	20L Pail	26	\$69.07	\$1,795.82	\$63.06	\$1,639.56	\$48.60	\$1,263.60	\$38.89	\$1,011.14	\$65.35	\$1,699.10	\$43.20	\$1,123.20	\$27.42	\$712.92	\$41.38	\$1,075.88	\$64.60	\$1,679.60	\$46.11	\$1,198.86
13221	EP2, Grease - Multipurpose No. 29PEP2XXF	400g Cartridge	580	\$3.21	\$1,861.80	\$4.09	\$2,372.20	\$2.43	\$1,409.40	\$2.57	\$1,490.60	NO BID	NO BID	\$1.99	\$1,154.20	\$1.90	\$1,102.00	\$2.32	\$1,345.60	\$2.50	\$1,450.00	\$2.39	\$1,386.20
13241	Fluid, Power Steering No. 281PSXXLB	500ml Container	288	\$1.97	\$567.36	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$2.67	\$768.96	NO BID	NO BID	\$3.75	\$1,080.00	\$2.37	\$682.56	\$2.26	\$650.88	NO BID	NO BID	\$2.08	\$599.04
13229	Oil, Dexron III ATF No. 244D3MREB	1L Container	45	\$3.70	\$166.50	\$3.48	\$156.60	\$3.01	\$135.45	\$4.24	\$190.80	\$3.28	\$147.60	\$3.06	\$137.70	\$2.10	\$94.50	\$2.57	\$115.65	\$3.48	\$156.60	\$2.99	\$134.55
1	15W-40, XHD-7 Diesel Motor Oil; CJ-4/SM Duron-E no. DE18BLK	Bulk L	8,700	\$2.66	\$23,142.00	\$2.70	\$23,490.00	\$2.65	\$23,055.00	\$2.81	\$24,447.00	\$2.83	\$24,621.00	\$2.39	\$20,793.00	\$1.80	\$15,660.00	\$2.39	\$20,793.00	\$2.36	\$20,532.00	\$2.37	\$20,619.00
13232	15W-40, XHD-7 Diesel Motor Oil C-J; 22B1540LB	205L Drum	1	\$647.80	\$647.80	\$662.82	\$662.82	\$594.50	\$594.50	\$616.06	\$616.06	\$713.12	\$713.12	\$530.95	\$530.95	\$399.75	\$399.75	\$544.35	\$544.35	\$576.05	\$576.05	\$537.10	\$537.10
17815	15W-40, XHD-7 Diesel Motor Oil; CJ-4/SM Duron-E no. DE19F20	20L Pail	1	\$71.15	\$71.15	\$65.99	\$65.99	\$61.60	\$61.60	\$67.15	\$67.15	\$70.77	\$70.77	\$65.00	\$65.00	\$41.00	\$41.00	\$52.49	\$52.49	\$59.40	\$59.40	\$58.06	\$58.06
13233	15W-40, XHD-7 Diesel Motor Oil; CJ-4/SM Duron-E no. DE15C12	1L Container	4	\$3.76	\$15.04	\$3.94	\$15.76	\$3.44	\$13.76	\$3.53	\$14.12	\$4.08	\$16.32	\$3.37	\$13.48	\$2.14	\$8.56	\$2.94	\$11.76	\$3.03	\$12.12	\$3.13	\$12.52
13231	10W30 SM, GF-4 Gasoline Motor Oil; Supreme no. MOSP13C12	1L Container	20	\$3.45	\$69.00	\$3.82	\$76.40	\$3.10	\$62.00	\$4.54	\$90.80	NO BID	NO BID	\$3.06	\$61.20	\$2.12	\$42.40	\$2.65	\$53.00	\$3.42	\$68.40	\$3.01	\$60.20
17531	10W30 CI-4/SL Gasoline Motor Oil; Duron-E no. DE13DRM	205L Drum	6	\$686.81	\$4,120.86	\$661.00	\$3,966.00	\$576.05	\$3,456.30	\$685.11	\$4,110.66	NO BID	NO BID	\$502.25	\$3,013.50	\$477.65	\$2,865.90	\$583.18	\$3,499.08	\$674.45	\$4,046.70	\$547.35	\$3,284.10
2	AW 32, Hydraulic Oil Performance Plus no. 31AW32XEB	Bulk L	17,500	\$2.68	\$46,900.00	\$2.68	\$46,900.00	\$2.09	\$36,575.00	\$2.02	\$35,350.00	\$2.45	\$42,875.00	\$1.69	\$29,575.00	\$1.36	\$23,800.00	\$1.88	\$32,900.00	\$1.98	\$34,650.00	\$1.85	\$32,375.00
3	AW 32, Hydraulic Oil Performance Plus no. 31AW32XEB	205L Drum	1	\$666.93	\$666.93	\$630.63	\$630.63	\$463.30	\$463.30	\$549.65	\$549.65	\$653.46	\$653.46	\$358.75	\$358.75	\$319.26	\$319.26	\$422.92	\$422.92	\$545.30	\$545.30	\$409.15	\$409.15
4	Oil, Dexron III ATF Performance Plus No. 244D3MREB	Bulk L	8,100	\$3.84	\$31,104.00	\$2.86	\$23,166.00	\$2.55	\$20,655.00	\$3.25	\$26,325.00	\$2.96	\$23,976.00	\$2.71	\$21,951.00	\$1.48	\$11,988.00	\$2.29	\$18,549.00	\$2.30	\$18,630.00	\$2.09	\$16,929.00
5	5W-20 SM, GF-4 Motor Oil Supreme no. MOSP52BLK	Bulk L	2,300	\$2.68	\$6,164.00	\$2.94	\$6,762.00	\$2.81	\$6,463.00	\$3.34	\$7,682.00	\$3.07	\$7,061.00	\$2.70	\$6,210.00	\$1.93	\$4,439.00	\$2.27	\$5,221.00	\$2.19	\$5,037.00	\$2.09	\$4,807.00
13222	Grease - EP2	180 kg Drum	4	\$1,291.20	\$5,164.80	\$1,596.00	\$6,384.00	\$903.60	\$3,614.40	\$958.32	\$3,833.28	\$1,122.87	\$4,491.48	\$777.60	\$3,110.40	\$794.25	\$3,177.00	\$813.53	\$3,254.12	\$899.50	\$3,598.00	\$423.81	\$3,375.24
13224	Grease - OZ2; Peirless no. PLOG2C30	400g Cartridge	390	\$5.82	\$2,269.80	\$2.82	\$1,099.80	\$4.65	\$1,813.50	\$2.83	\$1,103.70	NO BID	NO BID	\$1.99	\$776.10	NO BID	NO BID	\$4.18	\$1,630.20	\$3.29	\$1,283.10	\$4.23	\$1,649.70
13226	Grease - Kendal L427; Precision XL 2 no. FXL2KGL	54 kg Keg	1	\$426.07	\$426.07	\$1,058.00	\$1,058.00	\$295.92	\$295.92	\$393.37	\$393.37	\$1,122.87	\$1,122.87	\$276.00	\$276.00	NO BID	NO BID	\$246.50	\$246.50	\$373.68	\$373.68	\$439.50	\$439.50
17201	Oil - 5W 20; Supreme no. MOSP52C12	946 ml Bottle	221	\$3.55	\$784.55	\$3.70	\$817.70	\$3.10	\$685.10	\$4.54	\$1,003.34	NO BID	NO BID	\$3.04	\$671.84	\$2.27	\$501.67	\$2.65	\$585.65	\$3.47	\$766.87	\$3.24	\$716.04
13217	Oil - Form; Paraflex HT5 no. PHT5DRM	205L Drum	3	NO BID	NO BID	\$948.70	\$2,546.10	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$426.88	\$1,280.64	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$541.20	\$1,623.60	\$397.44	\$1,192.32	
17583	Lubricant - 80W/90; Traxon no. TR89K60	60L Keg	13	\$272.00	\$3,536.00	\$227.76	\$2,960.88	\$188.40	\$2,449.20	\$229.86	\$2,988.18	\$236.02	\$3,068.26	\$181.80	\$2,363.40	NO BID	NO BID	\$169.61	\$2,204.93	\$205.80	\$2,675.40	\$208.40	\$2,709.20
13228	Lubricant - 80W/90; Traxon no. TR89DRM	205L Drum	25	\$926.60	\$23,165.00	\$685.68	\$17,142.00	\$623.20	\$15,580.00	\$687.06	\$17,176.50	\$710.50	\$17,762.50	\$607.76	\$15,194.00	NO BID	NO BID	\$570.37	\$14,259.25	\$619.10	\$15,477.50	\$682.20	\$14,555.00
15705	Oil - 5W 30; Supreme no. MOSP53C12	946 ml	144	\$3.45	\$496.80	\$3.76	\$541.44	\$3.10	\$446.40	\$4.54	\$653.76	NO BID	NO BID	\$3.06	\$440.64	\$2.27	\$326.88	\$2.65	\$381.60	\$3.47	\$499.68	\$3.20	\$460.80
20390	Khameleon Universal Antifreeze Coolant	205L Drum	30	\$1,382.82	\$41,484.60	\$580.90	\$17,427.00	\$709.30	\$21,279.00	\$285.29	\$8,558.70	NO BID	NO BID	\$291.10	\$8,733.00	NO BID	NO BID	\$384.64	\$11,539.20	NO BID	NO BID	\$273.75	\$8,212.50
6	Lubricant - 80 W90 Performance Plus No. 2659090LB	Bulk L	2,300	\$4.41	\$10,143.00	\$3.43	\$7,889.00	\$3.05	\$7,015.00	\$3.30	\$7,590.00	\$3.55	\$8,165.00	\$2.77	\$6,371.00	\$2.55	\$5,865.00	\$2.60	\$5,980.00	\$2.96	\$6,808.00	\$2.59	\$5,957.00
				SUBTOTAL		\$178,005.77		\$155,598.58		\$155,339.57		\$147,151.05		\$133,148.15		\$77,221.45		\$132,495.44		\$130,187.40		\$128,926.66	
				HST		\$23,140.75		\$20,227.82		\$20,194.14		\$19,129.64		\$17,309.26		\$10,038.79		\$17,224.41		\$16,924.36		\$16,760.47	
				GRAND TOTAL		\$201,146.52		\$175,826.40		\$175,533.71		\$166,280.69		\$150,457.41		\$87,260.24		\$149,719.85		\$147,111.76		\$146,687.13	
				Payment Terms		Net 30 Days		Net 30 Days		Net 30 Days		Not Indicated		Net 30 Days		Net 30 Days		Net 15, MF		Net 30 Days		Net 30 Days	